
START:  “Begin — to begin is half the work, let half still remain; again begin this, and thou 
wilt have finished.”  To do what I have come to do, I simply need to start.  It is 
uncomplicated.  As a matter of fact, once I “start” I am energetically halfway there.  For it 
is in action, that I create the momentum of manifestation.  It matters little whether I am 
younger or older, whether it is my first time or if I have seen many turns.  It only matters 
that I involve myself in my purpose, fully.  There may be times when what I am trying to 
achieve or accomplish seems out of sight, or even lost.  I will not be discouraged, nor 
doubt.  For my ally is Spirit and the Universe, and they know I will do my part (because I 
know they will).  It is in my willingness to start, and follow-through, that brings me the 
backing of legion.

VIBRANCY:  The warmth and brightness that is within attracts that which seeks it.  In 
other words, I draw it in and it in turn draws me.  When I remember why I am here, and 
doing it, I am alive!  I’m high on life.  It is a matter of tuning-in.  Much like an old radio, 
rotating the dials to get the station tuned just right; so there is no static, only clear music.  
It is a vibrancy.  I could say it is like a thrust in life; something unique “tuned” to me.  I do 
not let it dissipate nor get covered up.  I keep it warm and bright inside, even when I am 
at rest.  I am loyal to this, as I have experience in trying to find it.  Meaning, I have lost 
the feeling in the past.  I understand better why there must be loyalty & responsibility to 
self; being tuned-in and moving-to-the-music is part of why I am here.  Without clarity I 
will be listening to static or stations that pale to purpose.

DYNAMISM:  “A leader is a dealer in hope.”  But hope without involvement leads to lack, 
and diminished results.  I share more than “hope.”  I share inspiration!  For once touched 
with true inspiration, it will never leave.  It lifts and guides to higher levels of 
consciousness.  With “inspiration” come solutions.  I could say, inspiration is my job.  The 
“solutions,” are what come when I am doing the job.  If I am given an opportunity, and 
that opportunity is in my best interest, it is as good as done.  I will not waste anything.  I 
could have no money, little schooling, look unattractive and have little skill . . . but if there 
is dynamism, I will attract and develop all that is needed.  Make no mistake, “dynamism” 
is not just about spirit, it is also about progress and success.  That makes for inspiration 
and growth.   It’s the “umption-in-my-gumption.”

TRANSFORMATION:  When I hang on to old ideas, that no longer fit, it’s like holding on 
to an anchor in chest deep water, as the tide starts coming in.  Pretty soon I am fighting 
nature, the universe and anything or anyone else I can think of . . . at least until the water 
gets to my mouth.  Better to let go and find a better idea to work with.  Otherwise, I will 
hold my breath or perhaps let go only temporarily, until the water goes back down 
enough to re-grab the anchor (over and over again, unfortunately).  The truth is I only 
change when there is a pressing need.  Positive transformation comes when I embrace 
that “need”; when I fulfill on the soul desire.  I do this constantly, every day.  Sometimes 
the changes are small and I don’t see them; much like the turning of the seasons —  to 
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suddenly the snow is gone and the flowers are blooming.  It didn’t happen overnight.  
As a matter of fact, it may take a really long time.  Transformation is ever-present to the 
soul.  All I need to do, is to stoke my desires.

POWERFUL:  There is but one measure of success which will remain when all has 
passed; that will be my own.  It begins with the question: “What is success to me?”  Not 
my loved-ones, not according to my community, not to the prime minister or president.  
Only to “Me.”  I cannot take anything with me when it is time to go, other than my 
consciousness.  I can enjoy all the things of planet earth; for all of it is important and 
has value, and I respect them greatly.  But, it is what I take with me which will really 
make the difference.  When I allow that to be my priority, while still enjoying physical 
things, my life will take on a whole new meaning and level of success.  I will actually 
have more happiness, success and abundance because I am unafraid.  And that will 
make me powerful . . . really powerful!  All that comes to me, be it ‘good’ or ‘bad,’ will be 
purified into light and flame.  What else am I here for, but to free myself, to be an 
example and to be of service.  This fuels my eternal flame.  It is the fire of life and burns 
bright inside me as I move ever forward.
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